
SUPPLEMENT TO

The Watchman and Southron.
SUMTER, S. C., NOVEMBER 16, 1886,

ANNUAL REPORT
OF THE

County Commissioner^
OF SUMTER COUNTY,

For the Fiscal Year, Ending
October Sid, 1886.

APPROVED ACCOUNTS.
The following Accounts have been

-approved and audited, since October
31st, 1885:

Roads and Bridges.
1883.
NOT. ST-B J Diek, hauling
lumber and bridge work, i

Nov. 10-O E Hodge, repair¬
ing bridges, Pocotaligo,

Nov. 16-JE Atkins, lumber
for bridges,,

Nov. 19-Soule Mellett, repai¬
ring bridges, Pocotaligo,. <

Nov. 80-Jno J Shaw, build-
lng footway Broad Branch,

Nov. 21-W G Wells, lumber
forbridges. i

Nov. 23-H w Bernbert, re¬
pairing bridges, Rytten-
tenberg's Mill, 4

Nov. 25-JohnBCarr, lumber
for bridges, í

Nov. 30-j A Boykin, repair- .

ing bridge, lamber, &c. on
Black River,

Nov. 30-Jos E Hodge, servi¬
ces on Surrey, new Road,
across Pocotaligo Swamp,

Nov. 30-Jos P .Richardson,
services, survey new Road,
across Pocotaligo Swamp,

Nov, 30-WN Davis, services
survey new Road, across
Pocotaligo swamp,

Nov. 30-Lee Cockerill, servi¬
ces, survey new road, across
Pocotaligo swamp,

Nov. 30-John C Hodge, ser¬
vices, survey new road,
across Pocotaligo swamp,

Nov. 30-Isaac N Nichols, D.
S., surveying new road,
across Pocotaligo swamp,
calculations, &c. 2

Dec. 1-Joe Keith, repairing
bridge. Stateburg. !

Dec. 3-John E Muldrow,
lumber for bridge. <

Dec. 3-W S Chandler, re¬

pairing bridge,Rocky Bluff
and hauling lamber, &c. Í

Dec8-SE Shaw, repairing
bridge, Rocky Bluff and
hauling lumber &c. 1

Dec. 10-J A Dennis, repair¬
ing bridge, near Player's I

Dec 21-C P Mallett, lumber
for bridges, 2i

Dec 22-Soule Mellett, re¬
pairing bridges at Bear
Branch& Branson swamp, IS

Dec 22-Thos. O Sanders,
lumber, baulingand bridge
work near Sanders* TO, 2?

Dec.22-Alva J Pringle, .

building, bridge, Concord
(T S) * 8

Dec 23-T M Muldrow, haul¬
ing bridge lumber, 5

Dec 31-W W Mellett, lum¬
ber, hauling and work on
bridge canal, Dinkins' mill ll

Dec 31-Wallace Sanders,
freight on lumber bridges, 4

Dec 31-T J Price, services
on DuBose s bridge, 12

1886.
Jan. 1.-J B Carr, lumber for

bridges,- 3
Jan. 2-D E Keels, services
as special road commission¬
er, 10

Jan. 3-R J Dick, h'ling lum¬
ber and bridge work, De-
Schamps' mill, 6

Jan. 2-BE Nesbit, services
as special road commis¬
sioner, 7

Jan. 2-M L McElveen, ser¬
vices as special road com¬
missioner. 7

Jan. 3-M P Moore, repairs
. bridge Big Rafting Creek, 5

Jan. 4-C C Wilson, services
as special road commis¬
sioner. 10

Jan. 4-B J Welch, services
as special road commission¬
er, 9 days, 18

Jan. 4-J M Tomlinson, ser¬
vices as special load com¬
missioner, 10

Jan. 10-Wallace Sanders,
freight on bridge lumber 1

Jan. 10-Isaac Newman, hire
wagon on DeSchamps' mill
dam, 1

Jan. 25-E C Keels, repairing
6 bridges in R. Creek, T. S.,
price decided by arbitra¬
tion, 158

Jan. 28-J Nelson Hudson,
repairs 2 bridges Black Ri¬
ver, 3

Feb. 1-C C Wilson, services
as special road commis¬
sioner, 5

Feb. 1-J A Boykin, lumber
and hauling, bridges, Man¬
ville township, 3 i

Feb. 4-Epperson & Co., lum¬
ber for bridges, 2 :

Feb. 10-Jacob Reels, bui'ing
bridge, Pudding swamp, 72 <

Feb. 15-Wallace Sanders,
hauling bridge lumber. 12 i

Feb. 25-0 C Scarborough,
"bridge lumber and haul¬

ing .12 1
Feh. 26-J E Wjl$on< bridge
* lumber, I i
Feb. 27-B E Muldrow, lunv
' ber and hauling. 3 <
FeT>. 27-jADenms, building
-bridge at Cooter branch,
Shiloh township, 255

FeW 2^-Wallaoe Sanders,
tor hauling lumber. 4 S

Feb. 2d-John C Hodge, ser-.
vices special road commis-.
sibner, Tri

Mcb.i-CH Singleton, ser- s

vices as special road com:
missioner, 2 6

Men. 1-J F Scott, services,
as special road commis-.
sioner, 2 6

Mch. 1-B F Hoyt, services
as special road, commisr.
sioner.

' 2 6

Mch. 17-Chas H Singleton,
repairing bridge, old R R
(G Swamp) IS

Heh. 18-Moses and Harby,
lumber for bridges, 3

Men. 24-J F Scott, hire of
j. wagons on factory road

from fund paid by road
hands, 10

Men. 24-P H Prescott, re¬
pairing bridges, Sca^e O'er
swamp, 9

Mch. 25-L N Barwick, haul¬
ing and lumber for bridge, 1

Mch. 29 -J E Atkins, lumber
for bridges. 3

Mch. 31-N S McLeod, lum¬
ber for bridge work inS.

' Pens (T S) 12 <

April 2-W S Chandler, re¬

pairing bridges, hauling.
&c. at R B swamp, 9 i

April 2-C P Mallett, bridge
lumber, 17 1

April 3-Ñero Tindall, work
on factory road, 3 <

April 13-R J Dick, repairs
bridge at 1st mill, 1 <

April 14-Wallace Sanders,
repairing bridge, R. Creek
township, 3 Í

April 16-Wallace Sanders,
repairing bridge at Dry
swamp & timbers furnished 13 :

April 25-O C Scarborough,
building bridge near Stuc-
kev's mill, &c. 54 (

April 26-Saml. E Shaw, re¬

pairing bridge on R. B.
swamp and lumber, 7 i
April 29- J W Walters, re¬

pairing DuBose's bridge, 68 I
May 1-Soule Mellett, Rail¬
ing old Ford bridge, 3 í

May 1-W W D Chandler, re¬
pairs bridges, R. B. swamp,
and lumber, 42 (

May 4^E B Shaw, repair mill
pond bridge, 1 í

May 5-Rich'd. Gayle, bridge
Beach Creek, lumber, em¬
bankment, &c. 52 S

May 5-WWD Chandler, re¬

pairs Turkey Creek bridge. 1 ?
May 6-W W D Chandler, re¬

pairs bridges Moses Cross¬
ing, lumber, hauling, &c. 20 7

May 6-Epperson & Co. lum¬
ber for bridges, 13 7

May 7-W Frank Timmons,
building bridge, Lynches
River at Hudson's, ¿, 117 2

May 8-Nero Tindall, work
on factory road. 1 3

May 20-WallaceSanders, re¬

building bridge Dry swamp
&c. 15 0

May 24-John J. Shaw, re¬
pairs bridge Wells X roads, 4 4

May 24-Arthur K Sanders,
repairing bridges, B C.
T. S.. 25 0

June 1-J E Brown, repair¬
ing bridges at Reynolds &
Bracey's mills, 55 0

June 1-J E Atkins, bridge
lumber, 10 4

June 4-D H Boykin, repair¬
ing bridges, B. River, Scap
O'er and Church Branch,
and lumber furnished, 29 3;

June 7-Nero Tindal, work
on factory road, 3 0

June 7-W A Partin, bridge
work, Reynold's mill, 7 Ol

June28^-J*E Atkins, bridge
lumber, 22 2'

June 30-RW DuRant & S'n,
road tools. &c. 7 51

July 1-E H Holman, haul-
ingrlumber. &c. 9 ll

July 1-J R Burke, repairing
bridge McCrea's mill, 3 3(

July 7-W W D Chandler, re¬
pairing bridge. Scape O'er, 24 &

July 10-J T Davis, lumber,
bridges, .

7 7Í
July 12-O C Scarborough,
bridge lumber and hauling, 15 7i

July 15-Artnur K Sanders,
bridge work, lumber. &c. 15 0(

July 23-HeartwellCrosswell,
bridge work, &c. Bear
Branch. 5 0C

July 24-J S Dinkins, bridge
work, Loring's mill, &c. 4 4i

July 20-Jacob Keels, build¬
ing 3 bridges at Hudson's,
Lynches River, 150 0C

Aug. 2-W G Wells, bridge
lumber and hauling. 7 23

Aug. 7-L M Smith & Bro.
lumber, hauling, &c. 6 08

Aug. ll-Moses & Harby,
lumber for bridges, 2 75

Aug. 15-Tyree Stuckey, re¬
pairs Carter's bridge,"i, ll 25

Aug. 15-W W McKenzie, re¬
pairs Stokes' bridge, 6 75

Aug. 15-J W Walters, re¬
pairs DuBose's bridge, A, 4 00

Aug. 17-J E Atkins, bridge,
lumber and hauling, 7 15

Aug. 23-W E Brunson,
bridge lumber, 1 02

Aug. 25-C C Wilson, build¬
ing bridge, Douglas sw'p, 30 00

Aug. 28-W D Trueluck, lum¬
ber for bridge and hauling, 35 43

Aug. 30-Peter Chatman,
hauling, lumber and nails, 175

Aug. 31-R J Dick, repairiug
bridge and hauling lumber,
Oxboro, 2 20

Aug, 31-R M Aman, lumber
for bridge, 2 35

Aug. 31-Isaac Ben, hauling
bridge lumber, 1 25

Aug. 31-T P Floyd, lumber
for bridges. 5 50

Aug, 31-John C Parnell,
work on Causeway, Mecha¬
nicsvii le. 20 0o

Sept. 1-W H Commander,
lumber, bridge work and
hauling, 2 50

Sept. 1-Essex Taylor, bridge
lumber, 3 55

Sept. 8--H H Player, bridge
lumber, 22 62

Sept. 3-L D Jervey, hire wa¬
gons on factory road, 2 50

Sept. 9-W S Mitchell, haul¬
ing bridge lumber. 1 io

Sept. 9-W W D Chandler,
repairing bridges, Moses'
Crossing, 5 00

Sept. 30-Powell Odom, re¬

pairing bridge, at Big Raft¬
ing Creek, near Railroad, 69 33

Sept. 30-J F Woodward,
bridge lumber, 6 10

Sept. 30- S W Trueluck,
bridge lumber, 7 33

Sept, 30^-FM Brown, repair¬ing bridge, Westberry s
Mill, 10 00 !

Sept. 30-H & H J-Harby,
lumber for bridges, 15 60

Sept. 3o-J.J Dickson, lumT
ber, for, bridges, 33 12 í

Sept. 30-W M Keels, repairs
Durant's bridge and tim¬
ber, Vz, 43

Sept. 30-"W M Reid, lumber
for bridges, 2

Oct.-1.-J no A Burgess, haul¬
ing lumber, 2

.Oct. 4-Thos. .0. Sanders; re^

pairing bridge Gum swamp 6
Oct. 9-0 C Scarborough,
bridge lumber, 16

Oct. 16-H Harby & Co.,
bridgé lumber, - 1

Oct. 18-S L .Windham, re¬
pairs bridge, plank and
hauling. .

1
Oct. 25-Jas. R. Jones, re-

:. r»airs 'bridges,', near Lode-
bar, : 13

Oct. 30-Thos. Ramsey, br'ge
lumber, ; 3

Oct. 30-Tyree .Stuekey, re¬
moving obstructions at Du-
Bose's Bridge, - 10

Oct.;30-W W BicKenzie, re¬
moving obstructions at
Stokes' bridge, 10

Total, ; V $2173 51
Oct. 1-Jacob Keels, on ac¬
count of contract to build
Crossing new road Poctali-

. go swamp, 497 00

Poor House and Poor.
1885,
Nov. 16-Altamont Moses,
supplies for poor,

Nov. 30-J H Cooper, sup¬
plies for poor,

Nov. 30-Wm, Hinson, sup¬
plies for poor,

Nov. 30-Mrs A J Hussey,
feeding, &c, paupers at P.
house,

Nov. 30-Bultman and Bro.
shoe for crippled pauper,

Dec. 7-T J Baker, supplies
for poor,

Dec. 7-D W Chandler, cot-
fin for pauper,

Dec. 7-Cain & Dwight, sup¬
plies for poor,

Dec. 7-J Ryttenberg & S'ns,
supplies for poor,

Dec. 15-A A Solomons, sup¬
plies for poor,

Dec. 16-Dr Chas L Crane,
medical attention to pau¬
per,

Dec. 16-Altamont Moses,
supplies for poor,

Dec. 20-Dr W J Pringle,
medical attention to pau¬
pers,

Dee. 23-A A Solomons,
clothing, &c. for paupers,
at poor house,

Dec. 29-Myles MoraD, sup¬
plies for paupers,

Dec. 31-E Spencer, supplies
for poor.

Dec. 31-Dr Jno A Hughson,
medical services, P. house
and jail.

Dec 30-J S Corbett, sup¬
plies for poor,

Dec. 31-Mrs A J Hussey,
feeding &c, paupers at P.
house,

1886. .

Jan. 1-John E Muldrow,"-
supplies for poor.

Jan. 7-Altamont Moses sup¬
plies for poor,

Jan. 19-John D Craig, cof¬
fins for paupers, 2.

Jan. 26-Hugh McRae, coffin
for pauper,

Jan. 31- K Mccaskill, sup¬
plies for poor,

Jan. 31-Mrs A J Hussey,
feeding, &c, paupers at P.
house,

Feb. 1-L M Smith & Bro.
supplies for poor,

Feb. 1-J L Parrott, supplies
for poor,

Feb. 1-J A Boykin, supplies
for poor,

Feb. 2-\YH Yates, supplies
for poor.

Feb. 4--J D Craig, coffin for
pauper,

Feb. 13-Pate Bros., supplies
for poor,

Feb. 15-John J Muldrow,
supplies for poor,

Feb. 16-J T Tallon, supplies
for poor,

Feb. 17-J Ryttenberg ¿.'Sons
supplies for poor,

Feb. 24-Altamont Moses,
supplies for poor.

Feb 26-J W Cooper, supplies
for poor,

Feb 28-Mrs A J Hussey.
feeding, &c paupers at P.
house,

Men. 1-J L Parrott, supplies
for poor,

Mch. 1-John E Muldrow,
supplies for poor,

Mch. 6 -A A Solomons, sup¬
plies for poor,

Mch. 6-W H *ates, supplies
for poor.

Mch. 18-W S Scarborough,
supplies for poor.

Mch. 20-W M Keels, sup¬
plies for poor,

Mch. 30-Altamont Moses,
supplies for poor,

Mcb,30-DrJA Mood, phy¬
sician poor house and jail,

Mch. 31-J L Parrott, sup¬
plies for poor,

Mch. 31-Mrs A J Hussey,
feeding, &c.x paupers at P.
house,

April 1-J S Corbett, supplies
for poor,

April 1-J J Muldrow, sup¬
plies for poor,

April 1-J W Cooper, supplies
for poor,

April l-John E Muldrow,
supplies for poor,

April 1-Pate Bros., supplies
for poor.

April 5 -J T Tallon, supplies
for poor,

April 5-J A Boykin supplies
for poor.

April 6-W H Yates, supplies
for poor,

April 30-Altamont Moses,
supplies for poor,

April 30 -Cain & Dwight, sup¬
plies for poor,

April 30-J Ryttenberg & Sns
supplies for poor.

April 30-Mrs A J Hussey,
feeding, &c, paupers at P.
house,

May 1-J W Cooper, supplies
for poor.

May 1-John E Muldrow,.
supplies for poor,

May 1-7 J Muldrow, sup-
plies for poor, 2 50

May 1-John E Muldrow,
. supplies for poor, -. 2 00
May 1-J L Parrott, supplies
for poor/ . 31 50

May I-Pate Bros., supplies
for poor, 10 00

May 1-L M Smith & Bro.,
supplies for poor, 55 50 '

May 3-E P Bicker & Co.
supplies for poor, 4 00

Mav 4-^J Byttenberg & Sons
supplies for poor, 3 50

May 7-J W Lowry, supplies
for poor, 12 00

May 25-W M Sanders, sup-
plies for poor, 3 00

May 29r-A A Solomons, sup¬
plies for poor, 38 00

May 29-Altamont Moses,
supplies for poor. 24 00

May 31-W S Scarborough, m j
supplies for poor, 1 50

May 31- Mrs A J Hussey,
feeding, &c. paupers at P.
house, 29 45

June 1-J P Moran, agent,
supplies for poor, 1400

June 1-Altamont Moses,
supplies for poor, 26 50

June 1-John E Muldrow,
supplies for poor, 5 00

June 2- Pate Bros., supplies
for poor, 10 50

June 5-J L Parrott, supplies
for poor, 24 50

June 7-W H Yates, supplies
for poor, 8 00

June 19-J D Craig, coffin for
pauper, 5 00.

J une 25-AA Solomons, clo¬
thing, paupers at poor¬
house, 3 93

June 26 John Kingman, bu¬
rial clothing, pauper. 1 84

June 30-A A Brearly, sup¬
plies for poor, 3 00

June 30-Dr J A Mood, phy¬
sician poor house and jail, 22 50

June 30-W S Scarborough,
supplies for poor. 1 50

June 30-Mrs A J Hussey,
feeding, &c, paupers at P.
house, 34 50

June 30-Dr Jno S Hughson,
medical attention to pauper, 1 50

July 1-J W Lowry, supplies
fo'r poor, 8 00

July 1-Pate Bros., supplies
for poor, 9 00

July 1-John E Muldrow,
supplies for poor, 3 00

July l-J J Muldrow, sup¬
plies for pQor, 2 50

July 2-J L Parrott, supplies
for poor, 24 50

July 5-Dr John H Furmaín,
medical attention to pau¬
pers, 16 75

July 9-Jas F Stubbs convey¬
ing sick pauper. $ 30

July 10-A Mosely, suppîies
for poor, . 12 00

July 12-Dr B E Dennis,
medical attention to pau¬
pers, 46 00

July 13-J W Cooper, sup¬
plies for poor, 17 50

July 18-Dr J A Mood, medi¬
cal attention to pauper, 3 00

July 19-E H Holman, sup-
plies for poor, 3 00

July 27-W S Scarborough,
supplies for uoor, 1 50 j

July 27-W D Ilinds, supplies
for poor, 16 50

July 31-Altamont Moses,
supplies for poor, 24 20

July 31-A A Solomons, sup¬
plies for poor, 44 40

July 31-Mrs A J Hussey,
feeding, &c, paupers, at P.
house, 34 20 i

July 31-E B Muldrow, sup-
plies for poor, 10 00

Aug. 1-J W Lowery, sup- _

plies for poor, . 4 00
Aug. 2-W H Yates, supplies

for poor. 1° 00
Aug. 2-Pate Bros,, suppiies

for poor. 9 00 ¡
Aug. 3-J L Parrott, supplies |

for poor, 19 50 j
Auy. 6-E P Bicker & Co. sup¬
plies for poor, 12 00

Aug. 9-Dr J A Mood, medi-
eal attention to pauper, 4 00

Aug 19-A A Solomons, sup- _

plies for poor, 13 50 |
Aug. 19-Dr W:J Pringle,
medical attention to pau-

^

per, 2 75
Aug. 20 W S Scarborough, >.

supplies for poor, 6 50
Aug. 20-W W Boyett, sup-

plies for poor, 21 00 ;

Aug. 24-W J McLeod, sup-
plies for poor, 6 00

Aug; 31-J A Boykin, sup-
plies for poor, 5 00

Aug. 31-Mrs A J Hussey,
feeding, &c, paupers at P.
house, 37 45

Aug.. 31-J. Byttenberg &
Sons, supplies for poor, 12 00

Aug. 31-J J Muldrow, sup-
plies for poor, 1 25 ¡

Aug. 31-L M Smith-& Bro., m m

supplies for poor, 55 50
Aug. 31-K Mccaskill, sup¬

plies for poor, 7 25 ?

Aug. 5-B J Barnett, supplies
for poor, December '85 to
date 44 50

Aug. 7-Ducker & Bultman,
supplies for poor, Jan. 4th,
to date, 42 50

Sept. 1-J P Wilson, supplies
for poor, 4 00

Sept 1-John E Muldrow, ¡
supplies for poor, 6 00

Sept. 6-J T Talion, supplies _

~ for poor, 2Ü 00
Sept; 6-J C Tidwell, coffin !

for pauper, 5 oo- ;
Sept. 16-W S Sacarborough,
suppîies for poor, 6 50 i

Sept. 10 J D Craig, coffins ;
for pauper«, 6, 27 50

Sept. 30-W D Hinds, sup¬
plies for poor, 6 00

Sept, 30-Pr. J A Mood, phy¬
sician poor house and jail, 2-2 50

Sept. 30-Mrs A J Hussey,
feeding, &c, paupers at P.
house, 28 50 ¡

Sept, 6-W H Yates, suppiies
(for poorT 2 00 ;

Sept. 23-Dr J J L Miller,
amputation of thigh, for
pauper, ¿fcc., A, 73 00

Oct. 1-John E Muldrow.sup-
plies for poor, 3 00 .

Oct. 1-John Kingman, sup¬
plies for poor, from July 1, j
to date, 37 00 «

Oct. 1-Edward ERemberf,
supplies for poor, from F.cl>.
1st, to date.. *£Q0::

Oct. 1-A White, supplies for
poor from November 1885 to *

date, 67 I
Oct. 1-W A Cooper, supplies
for poor, from March to
date, 12 I

Oct. 1-J Ryttenberg & Sons,
suppiies for poor, 5 '

Oct. 2-J W Cooper, supplies
for poor, 12 (

Oct. 4.-J p Wilson, supplies
for poor, 4 (

Oct. o-W W Rowland, furn¬
ishing coffin and burial
clothing, and interring dead
pauper, 10 (

Oct. 7-Timmons Smith, sup¬
plies for poor, 4 (

Oct. 9-W W DeScharaps.
supplies for poor, for May
1st, to date. 13 (

Oct. 14-R J Brownfield, sup¬
plies for poor, 8 (

Oct. 15--A A Brearly, sup¬
plies for poor, 6 <

Oct. 16-W S Scarborough,
supplies for poor, 5 (

Oct. 27-Dr JJLMiller,
medical attention to pau¬
per, i, 13 '

Oct. 27-J FW DeLorme, me¬
dicines, &c. for poor house
and jail, for year, 34 í

Oct. 28-John P Moran, ag't,
supplies for poor, 8 (

Oct. 28-F J Mayes, medi¬
cines for poor,

' 3 (
Oct. 30-Mrs. A J Hussey,
feeding, &c, paupers at P.
house, 31 Í

Oct. 30-L M Smith & Brö.,
supplies for poor, Sept'r.
and October, 27 (

Oct. 30-Jas E Mayes, sup¬
plies for poor, May, to date, 12 C

Total, $2,364 S

SJieriff's Accounts.
1885.
Nov. 30-Marion Sanders,

sheriff, dieting, &c., prison¬
ers, $67 4

Dec. 31-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, dieting, &c" prison¬
ers, 122 l

1886.
Jan. 31-Marion Sanders, .*.

sheriff, serving writs, V. F. 48 5
Jan. 31-Marion Sanders,

sheriff, dieting, ¿ic., prison¬
ers, 138 2

Feb. 13-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, cleaning up C. H.
&c., 7 2

Feb. 15-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, summoning wit¬
nesses, 90 7'

Feb. 15-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, serving writ, V. F. 26 3

Feb. 16-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, serving bench war¬
rants, 21 I»

Feb. 16-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, serving rules, IO* 7!

Feb. 20-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, conveying prison¬
ers, 41 5'

Feb. 28-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, dieting, &c.,. prison¬

ers, 158 3i
Mch.- 5-Ed. Perry & Co.,
books for sheriff's office, 32 0<

Mch. 31-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, conveying prison¬
ers, 79 li

Mch. 31-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, dieting, prisoners, 98 4í

April 30-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, serving bench war¬
rant, 3 7i

April 30 -Marion Sanders,
sheriff, dieting, &c. prison¬
ers, 96 9(

May 20-Marion Sanders.
sheriff, cleaning C. H. « ice 6 8(

May 25-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, writs, V. F. 55 3=

May 26-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, serving witnesses, 83 05

May 26-Marion Sanders,
Sheriff, summoning wit¬
nesses, 5 50

Mav 26 -Marion Sanders,
sheriff, serving Çench
warrants, 7 55

May 31-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, conveying prison¬
ers, ^8 02

May 31-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, dieting, &c, prison¬

ers, 151 00
June 18-Marion Sanders,

sheriff, conveying prison¬
ers, ll 52

June 23-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, conveying prisoners
under habeas corpus, 22 02

June 30-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, dieting, &c, prison¬

ers.HO 30
July 6-Marion Sanders,

Sheriff, conveying prison¬
ers, 6 85"

July 10-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, bringing up prison¬
er, on habeas corpus, 19 45

July 30-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, dieting, &c, prison¬

ers, I63 05
Aug. 16-Marion Sanders,

sheriff, serving habeas-cor¬
pus, 1 35

Aug. li*-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, conveying prison¬
ers, a

72 39
Aug. 24-Marion Sanders,

sheriff, conveying, prison¬
ers. 8- 23

Aug. 31-Marion Sanders^
sheriff, dieting prisoners, 239 75

Sept. 30-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, serving bench war¬
rants, 3 40

Sept. 30-Marron Sanders,
sheriff, serving writ, V. F. 28. 95

Sept. 30-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, dieting prisoners, 206 15

Sept. 30-J A Se hwerin, sup¬
plies, sheriff's office, 1 10

Oct. 12-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, serving rules Oct.
court, 25 90

Oct. 16-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, serving bench war¬
rants, Oct. court, 68 20 '

Oct. 18-Marion Sanders,
sheri IT. arresting by order
grand Jury, 5^ 00

Oct. 18-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, arresting witnesses,
order court, 222 45

Oct. 18-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, serving bench war¬

rants, order court, 4 05
Oct. 18-Marion SandtHrs,

sheriff, serving writs, V.E.. 52-70

Oct. 18-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, serving rules, order
court* 6 65

Oct. 21-Marion Sanders; .., :

sheriff; conveying prison¬
ers to penitentiary, 28 02

Oct. 23-Marion Sanders,
sheriff, cleaning up court
house, 7 50

Oct. 31-Marion Sanders,
' sheriff, dieting, &c. prison¬
ers in jail, 163 05

Total, $2,907 89

Triai Jmticei Accounts.
1886.
April-T D Jenkins, services tinder

salary, from November 1985 to

April, 1886, $* 43.75
Oct. Sl-^D E DaRant, services an¬

der salary, from April 7th to

October 31st. 1886, 56 25
Oct. 31-W. J. Beard, cervices
under salary for fiscal year 1885
and 1886, ,

'300 00
Oct. 31-Daniel Keels, Services

under salary for fiscal year 1885
and 1886, 100 00

Oct. 31-L. L. Carroll, services
under salary for fiscal year 1885
and 1886, - Í00 00'

Oct. 31-M E McDonald, services
under salary for fiscal year 1885
and 1886,

*

100 00

Oct. 31-J H McLeod, services an¬

der salary for fiscal year 1885
and 1886, 100 00

Oct. 31-Wm. O. Cain, Service«
under salary for fiscal year 1885
and 1886, 100 00

Oct. 31-Isaac N lenoir, servîtes
under salary for fiscal year I8Ä5»
and 1886, Í00.00

Oct. 31-W S Dinkins, services
under salary for fiscal year 1885
*and!886, * : 100 00

Tctal, $1,100 00

Constable Accounts.
1885.
Dec. 31-E B Mellett, service*
under salary from November 1st
to December 31st, 1885, $ 8 33

Dec. 31-J B Lemon, services un*
der Balary from November 1st to

December 31st, 1885, 8 34
1886. 3-

Oct. 31-Edward Harris, services '

under salary from January latte
Oct. 31st, 1886, 41 67

Oct.-31-W P DuBose, services
under salary from January 1st .

to October 31st, 1886. 4166
Oct. 31-A H Smith, services un¬

der salary for fiscal year 1885
and 1886, 50 00

Oct. 31-E G Brown, services un¬

der salary for fiscal year 1885
and 1886, - 50 00

Oct. 31-Tyler Dixon, services un¬
der salary for fiscal year 1885
and 1886, 50 00

Oct. 31-Prince A James, services
under salary for fiscal year 1885
and 1886, 50 00

Oct. 31-L A Wheeler,- services
under salary for fiscal year 1885
and 1386, 50 00

Oct. 31-Henry D Cain, services
under salary for fiscal year 1885
and-1886, 50 00

Oct. 31-Marion Sanders, sheriff,
services under salary for fiscal
year 1885 and 1886, 150 00

Total, $550 00

Coroners* Inquest, Post Mortem Examination»
and Lunacy Accounts.

1885.
No7.10-L A Wheeler, Constable,
summoning, Coroner's Jury, $ 2 00

Nov. 10-M E McDonald, Trial
Justice, services at I nquest 8 50'

Nov. 23-Dr J A Mood, examina¬
tion in lunacy, 5 00

Nov. 23-Dr J S Hughson, exami¬
nation ia lunacy, 5 00

No?. 23-W J Beard, affidavit in
lunacy, 1 00

Nov. 23-T V Walsh, Probate
Judge, proceeding in Lunacy, 3 00

Nov. 23-Marion Sanders, sheriff,
conreyiog lonatie, 13.02.

Dec. 28-Dr J M Sanders, exatnU.
nation in lunacy, 5 "00

Dec. 28-Dr E F Darby, examina- -

tion in lunacy, 5 00-
Dec. 28-M E McDonald, Trial -:

Justice, affidavit in lunacy, 1*00
Dec. 29-T V Walsh; Probate
Judge, proceeding in lunacy, 3~ 60

Dec. 30-Marion Sanders, Sheriff,
conveying lunatics, 16 53

1886.
Jae. 10-W. Ol Cain, Trial Jus¬

tice, services at inquest, 8 50

Jan. 10-Dr J H Furman, post--!
mortem examination, fte-., 10 00

Jan. 10-W F Roane* Coroaer,
services, examination- causer of'
death. 3 00

Jan. 10-Henry P.* Cain, consta*
ble, summoning Coroner's-jury, 2 00

Jan. 13-Dr W W Fraser, post
mortem examination, ¿c., 10 30

Jan. 13-L L Fraser, Jr., deputy
coroner, services holding in¬
quest, kc, 10 75

Jan. 13-H B Framer, com table,
summoning,.Coroner's Jury, 2 00

Jan. 15-J W P run, constable,
summoning, .Coroner's Jury, 2 00

Jan. 18-Jas H Mcleod, Trial
Justice, service* at inquest, 8 50


